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February 17, 2011

Bids for the purchase of Canvass Materials were opened at 1:30 p.m. on February 17, 2011. The following
bids were received:

Voter Registration Bid Open Canvass 2012
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Community Press $926.00 | $3,810.00 $580.00 $4,890.00 $1,031.00
Data Forms 542.52 2,891.30 $774.01 $4,018.79 $1,071.03
Edit Express
Elkins-Swyers Company, Inc. | $575.28 no bid $777.20 no bid no bid

Graphically Inclined Designs | $1,121.32 | $3,517.34 $696.82 $3,678.31 $969.78

Inter-State Printing

Kerley $1,734.85 | $3,628.30 $1,021.93 $5,538.00 $1,536.60
Lettercraft no bid $2,880.00 $690.00 $5,525.00 $1,225.00
Midland Printing $1,259.37 no bid $924.80 $6,570.00 $1,313.16
Print Lynx $595.08 | $5,164.90 $783.94 $5,824.71 $1,225.45
UCM Printing Services no bid $3,300.00 $499.00 $4,699.00 $1,272.00

Having reviewed the bids received, Commissioner Gabel moved and Commissioner Hough seconded to
award the bid for voter identification cards to Data Forms, the custom window and pocket envelopes to
Lettercraft, the business reply service postcards to UCM Printing Services, the information booklet to
Graphically Inclined Designs and the envelopes to Graphically Inclined Designs. The motion passed
unanimously.
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