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Bids for Johnson County Road and Bridge — Paving Oil were opened at 1:30 p.m. on May 3, 2018. The
following bids were received:

Rate would be
applicable after 2
hours, instead of 90
minutes. The first

two (2) hours or 120

minutes are free.

is figured at
$0.50 per gallon

$0.08/gallon will
be added to the
above prices if
Vance Brothers is
to deliver the
material

Company Name Costal Energy APAC- Vance Brothers, | Asphalt & Fuel
Corporation Central, Inc. Inc Supply, LL.C

Company Location | Willow Springs, MO | Springfield, MO | Kansas City, MO | Tulsa, OK

MC 30 (cost per $2.46 $2.42 $2.18 $2.09

gallon)

MC 3000 (cost per $2.16 $2.02 $2.05 $1.97

gallon)

EA 300 (cost per $1.93 no bid $1.65 no bid

gallon)

CRS - 2 (cost per $1.59 no bid $1.80 no bid

gallon)

Pump-Off Charge $75.00 $70.00 $65.00 $75.00

Hourly Unload Rate | $75.00 $70.00 $70.00 $75.00

Restocking Fee $0.00 $0.50 $450.00 $0.25 per gallon

Freight Charge $525.00 $0.00 $0.08 Included in price

Number of Gallons 5,600 Gallons 5,500 Gallons 5,500 Gallons 5,500 Gallons

Short Freight Load

Notes The Hourly Unload Restocking fee Freight charge of | $0.10 up charge

for every gallon
under 5,500
gallons for short
loads

The bids were taken under advisement and discussion tabled until Gary Bell, Road and Bridge Supervisor,
qualified the bids. Bell recommended the Commissioners accept the MC 30 at $2.18 per gallon, MC 3000 at
$2.05 per gallon, EA 300 at $1.65 per gallon and CRS — 2 at $1.80 all from Vance Brothers, Inc., Kansas

City, MO.

Commissioner Kavanaugh motioned and Commissioner Marr seconded to award Johnson County Road and
Bridge — Paving Oil to Vance Brothers, Inc., Kansas City, MO with MC 30 at $2.18 per gallon, MC 3000 at
$2.05 per gallon, EA 300 at $1.65 per gallon and CRS — 2 at $1.80. Motion approved.

JOHNSON COUNTY COMMISSION

ABSENT

William H. Gabel, Presiding Commissioner

U AT

/,John L. Marr, Eastern Commisgjoner

Charles Kavmmlssmner

Johnson County Courthouse, 300 North Holden, Warrensburg, MO 64093
Phone: (660) 747-2112 — Fax: (660) 747-9332 — countyclerk@jococourthouse.com — www.jococourthouse.com




